CCG PURCH RFQ 2017-142
EXPLORER PROGRAM UNIFORM APPAREL

BID TABULATION (See Summary on Page 2)

Bidder BJ Promotions Bob Barker Company Law Pro Graphics Maryland Small Arms Range National Ink and Stitch Old Town Tees Sans Screenprint TDI LLC
A. POLO SHIRTS, PORT AUTHORITY®, ITEM #K512, PERFORMANCE VERTICAL PIQUE POLO, SHORT SLEEVE, PRODUCT COLOR: SHADOW GRAY, GRAPHICS COLOR: BLACK
Item # . . . . . .
Unit Screen- . . Screen- Unit Screen- . . Screen- Unit Screen- Unit Screen- Unit Screen- Unit Screen-
Price Print Qty Total Unit Price Print Qty Total Price Print Qty| Total |Unit Price Print Qty| Total Price Print Qty Total Price Print Qty Total Price Print Qty Total Price Print Qty | Total
A-1 - Small $15.50 $0.00 30| $465.00 $10.49 $0.50{ 30} $329.70} $12.00 $2.00] 30| $420.00] $16.00 $0.00| 30| $480.00] $17.50 $0.00 30| $525.000 $13.30 $2.50] 30 $474.00]1 $18.48 $0.00] 30| $554.40
A-2 - Medium $15.50 $0.00 52| $806.00 $10.49 $0.50f 52| $571.48f $12.00 $2.00] 52| $728.00] $16.00 $0.00] 52| $832.00] $17.50 $0.00 52| $910.00] $13.30 $2.50{ 52 $821.60] $18.48 $0.00| 52| $960.96
A-3 - Large $15.50 $0.00 51| $790.50 No Bid $10.49 $0.50] 51| $560.49] $12.00 $2.00] 51| $714.00] $16.00 $0.00] 51§ $816.00f $17.50 $0.00 51| $892.50{4 $13.30 $2.50} 51 $805.80] $18.48 $0.00| 51| $942.48
A-4 - X-Large $15.50 $0.00 11| $170.50 $10.49 $0.50] 11]$120.89) $12.00 $2.00] 11| $154.00] $16.00 $0.00] 11{ $176.00] $17.50 $0.00 11] $192.50] $13.30 $2.50f 11 $173.80] $18.48 $0.00| 11} $203.28
A-5 - XX-Large $17.50 $0.00 1 $17.50 $11.49 $0.50 1] $11.99] $13.00 $2.00 1] $15.00] $18.00 $0.00 1} $18.00] $19.50 $0.00 11 $19.50] $14.65 $2.50 1 $17.15} $19.48 $0.00 1| $19.48
SUBTOTAL A $2,249.50 $1,594.55 $2,031.00 $2,322.00 $2,539.50 $2,292.35 $2,680.60
Bidder BJ Promotions Bob Barker Company Law Pro Graphics Maryland Small Arms Range National Ink and Stitch Old Town Tees Sans Screenprint TDILLC
B. POLO SHIRTS (FOR ADVISORS), PORT AUTHORITY®, ITEM #K512, PERFORMANCE VERTICAL PIQUE POLO, SHORT SLEEVE, PRODUCT COLOR: BLACK, GRAPHICS COLOR: GREY
Item # . . . . . .
Unit Screen- . . Screen- Unit Screen- . . Screen- Unit Screen- Unit Screen- Unit Screen- Unit Screen-
Price Print Qty Total Unit Price Print Qty Total Price Print Qty| Total (Unit Price Print Qty| Total Price Print Qty Total Price Print Qty Total Price Print Qty Total Price Print Qty Total
B-2 - Medium $21.00 $0.00 1 $21.00 $10.99 $0.50 1] $11.49] $12.00 $2.00 1| $14.00] $16.00 $0.00 1] $16.00] $17.50 $0.00 1| $17.50) $13.30 $2.50 1 $15.80] $19.23 $0.00 1] $19.23
B-3 - Large $21.00 $0.00 1 $21.00 $10.99 $0.50 1] $11.49] $12.00 $2.00 1| $14.00] $16.00 $0.00 1| $16.00] $17.50 $0.00 1l $17.50] $13.30 $2.50 1 $15.80] $19.23 $0.00 1| %$19.23
B-4 - X-Large $21.00 $0.00 1 $21.00 No Bid $10.99 $0.50 1| $11.49] $12.00 $2.00 1] $14.00] $16.00 $0.00 1| $16.00] $17.50 $0.00 1l $17.50] $13.30 $2.50 1 $15.80] $19.23 $0.00 1| $19.23
B-5 - XX-Large $23.00 $0.00 1 $23.00 $11.99 $0.50 1| $12.49] $13.00 $2.00 1] $15.00] $18.00 $0.00 1} $18.00] $19.50 $0.00 1] $19.50] $14.65 $2.50 1 $17.15F $20.23 $0.00 1] $20.23
SUBTOTAL B $86.00 $46.96 $57.00 $66.00 $72.00 $64.55 $77.92
Bidder BJ Promotions Bob Barker Company Law Pro Graphics Maryland Small Arms Range National Ink and Stitch Old Town Tees Sans Screenprint TDI LLC
C. YELLOW - HIGH-VISIBILITY T-SHIRTS, GILDAN®, ITEM #2000, ULTRA COTTON® T-SHIRT (NO POCKET), SHORT SLEEVE, PRODUCT COLOR: SAFETY YELLOW, GRAPHIC: BLACK
Item # . . N . . .
Unit Screen- . . Screen- Unit Screen- . . Screen- Unit Screen- Unit Screen- Unit Screen- Unit Screen-
Price Print Qty Total Unit Price Print Qy Total Price Print Qty| Total JUnit Price Print Qty| Total Price Print Qty ] Total Price Print Qty Total Price Print Qty Total Price Print Qty Total
C-1 - Small $5.00 $0.00 30| $150.00 $2.31 $0.50] 30| $84.30 $3.50 $2.00] 30{ $165.00 $5.07 $0.00] 30} $152.10 $7.50 $0.00 30| $225.00 $2.50 $2.50] 30 $150.00 $5.36 $0.00f 30| $160.80
C-2 - Medium $5.00 $0.00 521 $260.00 $2.31 $0.50] 52| $146.12 $3.50 $2.00| 52| $286.00 $5.07 $0.00 52| $263.64 $7.50 $0.00 52| $390.00 $2.50 $2.50| 52 $260.00 $5.36 $0.00{ 52| $278.72
C-3 - Large $5.00 $0.00 52| $260.00 No Bid $2.31 $0.50| 52| $146.12 $3.50 $2.00| 52| $286.00 $5.07 $0.00| 52| $263.64 $7.50 $0.00 52} $390.00 $2.50 $2.50| 52 $260.00 $5.36 $0.001 52| $278.72
C-4 - X-Large $5.00 $0.00 12 $60.00 $2.31 $0.50| 12| $33.72 $3.50 $2.00] 12| $66.00 $5.07 $0.00] 12| $60.84 $7.50 $0.00 12{ $90.00 $2.50 $2.501 12 $60.00 $5.36 $0.00{ 12| $64.32
C-5 - XX-Large $6.00 $0.00 2 $12.00 $4.11 $0.50 2 $9.22 $4.90 $2.00 2| $13.80 $7.07 $0.00 2| $14.14 $9.50 $0.00 2{ $19.00 $4.40 $2.50 2 $13.80 $6.36 $0.00 2| $12.72
SUBTOTAL C $742.00 $419.48 $816.80 $754.36 $1,114.00 $743.80 $795.28
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Bidder BJ Promotions Bob Barker Company Law Pro Graphics Maryland Small Arms Range National Ink and Stitch Old Town Tees Sans Screenprint TDI LLC
D. T-SHIRTS, GILDAN®, #2000, ULTRA COTTON® T- SHIRT (NO POCKET), SHORT SLEEVE, PRODUCT COLOR: BLACK, GRAHIC COLOR: WHITE
Item # . . . . . .
Unit Screen- . . Screen- Unit Screen- . . Screen- Unit Screen- Unit Screen- Unit Screen- Unit Screen-
Price Print Qty Total Unit Price Print Qty Total Price Print Qty] Total [Unit Price Print Qty| Total Price Print Qty Total Price Print Qty Total Price Print Qty Total Price Print Qty Total
D-1 - Small $5.00 $0.00 301 $150.00 $2.31 $0.50] 30| $84.30 $3.50 $2.00] 30| $165.00] ¢5.07 $0.00| 30} $152.10 $7.50 $0.00 30| $225.00 $2.50f $2.50{ 30 $150.00 $5.36 $0.00] 30| $160.80
D-2 - Medium $5.00 $0.00 52| $260.00 $2.31 $0.50] 52| $146.12 $3.50 $2.00| 52| $286.00] $5.07 $0.00| 52| $263.64 $7.50 $0.00 52| $390.00 $2.50| ¢$2.50| 52 $260.00 $5.36 $0.00| 52| $278.72
D-3 - Large $5.00 $0.00 52| $260.00 No Bid $2.31 $0.50| 52| $146.12 $3.50 $2.00| 52| $286.00] $5.07 $0.00| 52| $263.64 $7.50 $0.00 52| $390.00 $2.50| $2.50( 52 $260.00 $5.36 $0.00| 52 $278.72
D-4 - X-Large $5.00 $0.00 12 $60.00 $2.31 $0.50| 12| $33.72 $3.50 $2.00] 12| $66.00] $5.07 $0.00| 12| $60.84 $7.50 $0.00 12| $90.00 $2.50| ¢2.50( 12 $60.00 $5.36 $0.00] 12| $64.32
D-5 - XX-Large $6.00 $0.00 2 $12.00 $4.11 $0.50 2| $9.22 $4.90 $2.00] 2| $13.80] 47.07 $0.00 2| $14.14 $9.50 $0.00 2| $19.00 $4.40| $2.50 2 $13.80 $6.36 $0.00 2| $12.72
SUBTOTAL D $742.00 $419.48 $816.80 $754.36 $1,114.00 $743.80 $795.28
dd BJ Promotions Bob Barker Company Low Pro Graphics Maryland Small Arms Range National Ink and Stitch Old Town Tees Sans Screenprint TDI LLC
Bidder
E. BDU BASIC PANTS, TRU-SPEC, #1827, 6.5 OZ. 65/36 POLYSTER COTTON RIP-STOP, COLOR: BLACK
Unit Unit . . o . . . . o Unit
Item # Price Qty Total Price Qty Total Unit Price Qty Total Unit Price Qty Total Unit Price Qty Total Unit Price Qty Total Unit Price Qty Total Price Qty Total
E-1 - Small $17.00 15| $255.00 $20.00 15 $300.00 $27.00 15 $405.00 $18.95 15 $284.25
E-2 - Medium $17.00 20| $340.00 $20.00 20 $400.00 $27.00 20 $540.00 $18.95 20 $379.00
E-3 - Large No Bid $17.00 15] $255.00 No Bid $20.00 15 $300.00 $27.00 15 $405.00 No Bid No Bid $18.95 15 $284.25
E-4 - X-Large $17.00 10{ $170.00 $20.00 10 $200.00 $27.00 10 $270.00 $18.95 10 $189.50
SUBTOTAL E $1,020.00 $1,200.00 $1,620.00 $1,137.00
SUMMARY OF COSTS (INCLUDES COST OF SCREENPRINTING ON SHIRTS)
TOTALS BJ Promotions Bob Barker Company Law Pro Graphics Maryland Small Arms Range National Ink and Stitch Old Town Tees Sans Screenprint TDI LLC
SUBTOTAL A $2,249.50 No Bid $1,594.55 $2,031.00 $2,322.00 $2,539.50 $2,292.35 $2,680.60
SUBTOTAL B $86.00 No Bid $46.96 $57.00 $66.00 $72.00 $64.55 $77.92
SUBTOTAL C $742.00 No Bid $419.48 $816.80 $754.36 $1,114.00 $743.80 $795.28
SUBTOTAL D $742.00 No Bid $419.48 $816.80 $754.36 $1,114.00 $743.80 $795.28
SUBTOTAL E No Bid $1,020.00 No Bid $1,200.00 $1,620.00 No Bid No Bid $1,137.00
TOTAL BID $3,819.50 $1,020.00 $2,480.47 $4,921.60 $5,516.72 $4,839.50 $3,844.50 $5,486.08
F. GRAPHICS - SCREENPRINTING
F-1- One Time )
Set up Fee $0.00 No Bid $30.00 $0.00 No Charge No Charge $40.00 N/A
F-2 - Screenprinting $0.00 No Bid $0.50 $2.00 No Charge No Charge $2.50 N/A
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