BID NUMBER - PURCH 2017-106
DIVE EQUIPMENT

BID COMPARISON

Bidder

Item #1

Item #2

Item #3

Item #4

Item #5

Aluminum SCUBA Cylinder
Mfr; Metal Impact
Item #: AL80OBK

Guardian Full Face Mask

and Regulator

Mfr: Ocean Technology Systems
Item #: OTS-920001-001

Guardian Full Face Mask Hot Mic Dual
Earphone Assembly
Mfr: Ocean Technology Systems
Item #: OTS-910369-000

Aquacom® SSB-2010 4-Channel Diver

Transceiver

Mfr: Ocean Technology Systems
Item #: OTS-900272-00

MK17 EVO Regulator First Stage

Mfr: Scubapro

Item #: 10.714.010

Bidder

Unit Price ((g;y) Total Unit Price (?Etay) Total Unit Price (%gy) Total Unit Price (Cé’;y) Total Unit Price (?gg) Total
React Supply Service LLC $170.00 8 $1,360.00( $430.00 4 $1,720.00( $430.00 4 $1,720.00( $1,000.00 4 $4,000.00( $275.00 4 $1,100.00
American Diving Supply $167.00 8 $1,336.00( $489.00 4 $1,956.00( $482.00 4 $1,928.00( $1,078.00 4 $4,312.00( $198.50 4 $794.00
High-Tech Diving and Safety, Inc. $219.00 8 $1,752.00( $589.00 4 $2,356.00( $495.00 4 $1,980.00( $1,034.00 4 $4,136.00( $249.00 4 $996.00
Dive Rescue International $177.27 8 $1,418.16| $444.51 4 $1,778.04| $487.05 4 $1,948.20| $1,045.00 4 $4,180.00( $171.36 4 $685.44
Item #6 Item #7 Item #8 Item #9 Item #10

Guardian Rail with Universal Slide (No
Light)

Mfr: Ocean Technology Systems
Item #: 920013-000

LED Tail Switch Rechargeable

Dive Light

Mfr: Blackrock Diving Equipment

Item #: 01-111

Ranger Buoyancy Compensator

Mfr: Zeagle

Item #: 7907RK XL BCD

Scuba ProFile Scuba Dive Computer

Compact Console

Profile 2-Gauge with

Pressure Gauge
Mfr: Sherwood SCUBA
Item #: CR2509

SC-N-Compass-SC-N Module Only to
Add to Computer Console
Mfr: Sherwood SCUBA
Item #: SHER-SC-N

Unit Price (CI2EtaY) Total Unit Price (?E;y) Total Unit Price (%t;y) Total Unit Price ((étay) Total Unit Price (%2’) Total
React Supply Service LLC $220.00 4 $880.00[ $100.00 4 $400.00f $625.00 4 $2,500.00 $250.00 4 $1,000.00 $35.00 4 $140.00
American Diving Supply $239.00 4 $956.00 $69.00 4 $276.00] $465.00 4 $1,860.00 $274.00 4 $1,096.00 $38.50 4 $154.00
High-Tech Diving and Safety, Inc. $219.00 4 $876.00 $65.00 4 $260.001 $685.00 4 $2,740.00 $380.00 4 $1,520.00 $48.00 4 $192.00
Dive Rescue International $182.15 4 $728.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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BID COMPARISON (continued)

Bidder

Item #11

Item #12

Item #13

Item #14

Item #15

Wetsuit, Aquaflex 7mm Jump

Mfr; Agua Lung
Item #: 4040885

Wetsuit, Aquaflex 3mm Jump
Mfr: Aqua Lung
Item #: 4040975

Boot -- 6.5m Echozipp Ergo

Size: 9
Mfr: Aqua Lung
Item #: 1001703

Boot -- 6.5m Echozipp Ergo

Mfr: Aqua Lung
Item #: 1001703

Size: 10

Boot -- 6.5m Echozipp Ergo

Mfr: Aqua Lung
Item #: 1001703

Size: 11

Unit Price (%;y) Total Unit Price (Cétay) Total Unit Price (Sat?;) Total Unit Price (8;?;) Total Unit Price (l?at?;) Total
React Supply Service LLC $190.00 4 $760.00| $143.00 4 $572.00 $21.00 1 $21.00 $21.00 1 $21.00 $21.00 1 $21.00
American Diving Supply $247.00 4 $988.00( $178.00 4 $712.00 $30.00 1 $30.00 $30.00 1 $30.00 $30.00 1 $30.00
High-Tech Diving and Safety, Inc. $209.00 4 $836.00| $169.00 4 $676.00 $32.00 1 $32.00 $32.00 1 $32.00 $32.00 1 $32.00
Dive Rescue International $217.75 4 $871.00( $163.70 4 $654.80 $20.94 1 $20.94 $20.94 1 $20.94 $20.94 1 $20.94
Item #16 Item #17 Item #18

Bidder

Boot -- 6.5m Echozipp Ergo

Size: 12
Mfr: Aqua Lung
Item #: 1001703

Hood, Seahood Flex, 7/4mm
Mfr: Aqua Lung
Item #: 1001000

Thermocline Gloves, 5mm

Mfr: Aqua Lung
Item #: D350116

Total Lump Sum Bid

Unit Price (Sat?;) Total Unit Price (%tay) Total Unit Price (l?:?;) Total
React Supply Service LLC $21.00 1 $21.00 $27.00 4 $108.00 $27.00 4 $108.00 $16,452.00
American Diving Supply $30.00 1 $30.00 $38.00 4 $152.00 $19.50 4 $78.00 $16,718.00
High-Tech Diving and Safety, Inc. $32.00 1 $32.00 $38.00 4 $156.00 $39.00 4 $156.00 $18,760.00
Dive Rescue International? $20.94 1 $20.94 $26.93 4 $107.72 $15.05 4 $60.20 $12,515.92

1 Total Lump Sum Bid amount does not include all items.
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BID COMPARISON (continued)

Bidder

OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT

Option #1

Option #2

Option #3

RB-6V Rechargeable Battery
for STX-101
Mfr.: Ocean Technology Systems
Item #: 392008-000

RCS-13 Smart Battery Charger
Mfr.: Ocean Technology Systems
Item #: 910361-000

Headset Deluxe THB-101
for STX-101
Mfr.: Ocean Technology Systems
Item #: 900298-009

Unit Price (?E';Y) Total Unit Price (Cétay) Total Unit Price (?EE:\YL Total
React Supply Service LLC $37.00 8 $296.00 $90.00 4 $360.00| $330.00 4 $1,320.00
American Diving Supply $44.00 8 $352.00| $100.00 4 $400.00| $359.00 4 $1,436.00
High-Tech Diving and Safety, Inc. $89.00 8 $712.00 $98.00 4 $392.00| $359.00 4 $1,436.00
Dive Rescue International $41.67 8 $333.36| $100.93 4 $403.72 $369.44 4 $1,477.76

Bidder

Total Lump Sum Bid

Total Optional Equipment

Total if Purchasing All
Optional Equipment

React Supply Service LLC $16,452.00 $1,976.00 $18,428.00
American Diving Supply $16,718.00 $2,188.00 $18,906.00
High-Tech Diving and Safety, Inc. $18,760.00 $2,540.00 $21,300.00
Dive Rescue International' $12,515.92 $2,214.84 $14,730.76

1 Total Lump Sum Bid amount does not include all items.
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