
Item # 1
Short Sleeve

T-Shirt with Pocket

Item # 2
Short Sleeve Tall

T-Shirt

Item # 3
Short Sleeve
Active T-Shirt

Item # 4
Long Sleeve
Sweatshirts

Firm Name and Location Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style #

1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MP $5.53 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MT N/A 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29M $3.27 1. Small - Large Jerzee/562M $7.80
2. 1X - Large $5.53 2. 1X - Large $6.82 2. 1X - Large $3.27 2. 1X - Large $7.80
3. 2X-Large $7.26 3. 2X-Large $6.82 3. 2X-Large $5.34 3. 2X-Large $9.19
4. 3X Large $8.72 4. 3X Large $7.45 4. 3X Large $6.95 4. 3X Large $10.34

Item # 1
Short Sleeve

T-Shirt with Pocket

Item # 2
Short Sleeve Tall

T-Shirt
Item # 3

Short Sleeve
Active T-Shirt

Item # 4
Long Sleeve
Sweatshirts

Firm Name and Location Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style #

1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MPR $7.82 1. Small - Large
Port &
Company/PC55T LG ONLY    6.74 1. Small - Large Jerzees/29MR $5.39 1. Small - Large Jerzees/562MR $10.50

2. 1X - Large $7.82 2. 1X - Large $6.74 2. 1X - Large $5.39 2. 1X - Large $10.50
3. 2X-Large $10.40 3. 2X-Large $10.15 3. 2X-Large $7.55 3. 2X-Large $12.53

4. 3X Large $11.54 4. 3X Large $10.58 4. 3X Large $8.73 4. 3X Large $12.97

Item # 1 Item # 2 Item # 3 Item # 4

Firm Name and Location Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style #

1. Small - Large Jerzees/29MPR $4.74 1. Small - Large Port & $5.85 1. Small - Large Jerzees/29MR $2.28 1. Small - Large Jerzees/562MR $6.00
2. 1X - Large $4.74 2. 1X - Large $5.85 2. 1X - Large $2.28 2. 1X - Large $6.00

3. 2X-Large $6.29 3. 2X-Large $7.86 3. 2X-Large $4.97 3. 2X-Large $8.00

4. 3X Large $7.00 4. 3X Large $8.05 4. 3X Large $6.46 4. 3X Large $8.00

Item # 1
Short Sleeve

T-Shirt with Pocket

Item # 2
Short Sleeve Tall

T-Shirt

Item # 3
Short Sleeve
Active T-Shirt

Item # 4
Long Sleeve
Sweatshirts

Firm Name and Location Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style #

1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MPR $5.59 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MTXR $6.23 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29M $3.35 1. Small - Large Jerzee/562MR $7.65

2. 1X - Large $5.59 2. 1X - Large $6.23 2. 1X - Large $3.35 2. 1X - Large $7.65

3. 2X-Large $7.57 3. 2X-Large $6.23 3. 2X-Large $5.25 3. 2X-Large $9.64

4. 3X Large $8.96 4. 3X Large $7.46 4. 3X Large $7.65 4. 3X Large $10.73

Item # 1
Short Sleeve

T-Shirt with Pocket

Item # 2
Short Sleeve Tall

T-Shirt

Item # 3
Short Sleeve
Active T-Shirt

Item # 4
Long Sleeve
Sweatshirts

Firm Name and Location Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style #

1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MPR $4.82 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MTXR $6.04 1. Small - Large Jerzees/29MR $2.79 1. Small - Large Jerzees/562MR $6.29

2. 1X - Large $4.82 2. 1X - Large $6.04 2. 1X - Large $2.79 2. 1X - Large $6.29

3. 2X-Large $6.62 3. 2X-Large $6.04 3. 2X-Large $4.44 3. 2X-Large $8.09

4. 3X Large $7.89 4. 3X Large $6.65 4. 3X Large $5.65 4. 3X Large $9.09

Item # 1
Short Sleeve

T-Shirt with Pocket

Item # 2
Short Sleeve Tall

T-Shirt

Item # 3
Short Sleeve
Active T-Shirt

Item # 4
Long Sleeve
Sweatshirts

Firm Name and Location Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style #

1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MPR 5.98 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MTXR N/A 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MR 3.84 1. Small - Large Jerzee/562MR 7.36

6 2. 1X - Large 5.98 2. 1X - Large 6.56 2. 1X - Large 3.84 2. 1X - Large 7.36

3. 2X-Large 8.03 3. 2X-Large 6.56 3. 2X-Large 5.57 3. 2X-Large 9.14

4. 3X Large 9.05 4. 3X Large 7.54 4. 3X Large 6.87 4. 3X Large 10.13

RFQ 2017-098 - STAFF SHIRTS PARKS AND RECREATION

BID TABULATION

1
Artees Corporation

Doral, Fl 33166

2

Global Printing & Design
Solutions, Inc                       DBA

Proforma Global  Baltimore, MD

3
Midwest Graphics and Awards

Inc.                        Dexter, MI

4 International Promotioal Ideas
Elk

Grove Village, IL

5 SP Designs & MFG, Inc.  Cape
Coral, FL

Garage 68 Inc.
Plainview, New York



Item # 1
Short Sleeve

T-Shirt with Pocket

Item # 2
Short Sleeve Tall

T-Shirt

Item # 3
Short Sleeve
Active T-Shirt

Item # 4
Long Sleeve
Sweatshirts

Firm Name and Location Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style #

1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MPR 8.37 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MTXR no bid 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MR 5.34 1. Small - Large Jerzee/562MR 10.29

7 2. 1X - Large 8.37 2. 1X - Large 8.14 2. 1X - Large 5.34 2. 1X - Large 10.29

3. 2X-Large 10.01 3. 2X-Large 8.14 3. 2X-Large 7.26 3. 2X-Large 12.24

4. 3X Large 11.05 4. 3X Large 8.63 4. 3X Large 8.44 4. 3X Large 13.37

Item # 1
Short Sleeve

T-Shirt with Pocket

Item # 2
Short Sleeve Tall

T-Shirt

Item # 3
Short Sleeve
Active T-Shirt

Item # 4
Long Sleeve
Sweatshirts

Firm Name and Location Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style #

1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MP $5.35 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MT N/A 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29M $3.75 1. Small - Large Jerzee/562M $6.90

8 2. 1X - Large $5.35 2. 1X - Large $7.10 2. 1X - Large $3.75 2. 1X - Large $6.90

3. 2X-Large $7.20 3. 2X-Large $7.10 3. 2X-Large $5.30 3. 2X-Large $9.00

4. 3X Large $9.15 4. 3X Large $7.90 4. 3X Large $6.50 4. 3X Large $10.30

Item # 1
Short Sleeve

T-Shirt with Pocket

Item # 2
Short Sleeve Tall

T-Shirt

Item # 3
Short Sleeve
Active T-Shirt

Item # 4
Long Sleeve
Sweatshirts

Firm Name and Location Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style #

1. Small - Large Jerzees/29MP $5.10 1. Small - Large Jerzees/29MT N/A  No Bid 1. Small - Large Jerzees/29M $2.60 1. Small - Large Jerzees/562M $6.60

9 2. 1X - Large $5.10 2. 1X - Large $6.65 2. 1X - Large $2.60 2. 1X - Large $6.60

3. 2X-Large $7.15 3. 2X-Large $6.65 3. 2X-Large $4.50 3. 2X-Large $8.65

4. 3X Large $8.55 4. 3X Large $7.30 4. 3X Large $5.90 4. 3X Large $9.75

Item # 1
Short Sleeve

T-Shirt with Pocket

Item # 2
Short Sleeve Tall

T-Shirt

Item # 3
Short Sleeve
Active T-Shirt

Item # 4
Long Sleeve
Sweatshirts

Firm Name and Location Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style #

1. Small - Large Jerzees/29MP $4.75 1. Small - Large Gildan/2000T No Bid 1. Small - Large Jerzees/29M $2.64 1. Small - Large Jerzees/562M $6.23

10 2. 1X - Large $4.75 2. 1X - Large $5.76 2. 1X - Large $2.64 2. 1X - Large $6.23

3. 2X-Large $6.26 3. 2X-Large $6.29 3. 2X-Large $4.15 3. 2X-Large $7.98

4. 3X Large $6.26 4. 3X Large $6.29 4. 3X Large $4.15 4. 3X Large $7.98

Item # 1
Short Sleeve

T-Shirt with Pocket

Item # 2
Short Sleeve Tall

T-Shirt

Item # 3
Short Sleeve
Active T-Shirt

Item # 4
Long Sleeve
Sweatshirts

Firm Name and Location Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style #

1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MP $5.58 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MT N/A $ 4.00 1. Small - Large Jerzees/29MR $3.50 1. Small - Large Jerzees/562M $7.90

2. 1X - Large $7.58 2. 1X - Large $7.24 2. 1X - Large $3.50 2. 1X - Large $7.90

11 3. 2X-Large $7.58 3. 2X-Large $7.24 3. 2X-Large $5.50 3. 2X-Large $9.90

4. 3X Large $8.58 4. 3X Large $8.00 4. 3X Large $6.50 4. 3X Large $10.90

Item # 1
Short Sleeve

T-Shirt with Pocket

Item # 2
Short Sleeve Tall

T-Shirt

Item # 3
Short Sleeve
Active T-Shirt

Item # 4
Long Sleeve
Sweatshirts

Firm Name and Location Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style #

1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MPP $4.99 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MTXR $5.99 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MR $4.99 1. Small - Large Jerzee/562MR $7.77

12 2. 1X - Large $4.99 2. 1X - Large $5.99 2. 1X - Large $4.99 2. 1X - Large $7.77

3. 2X-Large $5.99 3. 2X-Large $6.99 3. 2X-Large $5.99 3. 2X-Large $8.99

4. 3X Large $5.99 4. 3X Large $6.99 4. 3X Large $5.99 4. 3X Large $8.99

Item # 1
Short Sleeve

T-Shirt with Pocket

Item # 2
Short Sleeve Tall

T-Shirt

Item # 3
Short Sleeve
Active T-Shirt

Item # 4
Long Sleeve
Sweatshirts

Firm Name and Location Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style #

1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MPR $5.57 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MTXR N/A 1. Small - Large Jerzees/29MR $2.59 1. Small - Large Jerzees/562MR $6.84

13 2. 1X - Large $5.57 2. 1X - Large $6.90 2. 1X - Large $2.59 2. 1X - Large $6.84

3. 2X-Large $7.65 3. 2X-Large $6.90 3. 2X-Large $5.91 3. 2X-Large $9.67

4. 3X Large $8.57 4. 3X Large $7.59 4. 3X Large $6.86 4. 3X Large $10.04

KNC Marketing         Waldorf,
MD 20602

H&R Workwear, Inc        DBA
Imagewear Uniforms

Westminster SC 29693

Tradewinds Studio Inc.
Elkridge, MD 21075

Radcal Boxing LLC         North
Bethesda, MD 20852

Eagle Group LLC    Columbus, IN
47801

Cole Enterpirsse LLC
Murfreesboro, TN 37127

Marylands Athletic House
Gaithersburg, MD 20879



Item # 1
Short Sleeve

T-Shirt with Pocket

Item # 2
Short Sleeve Tall

T-Shirt

Item # 3
Short Sleeve
Active T-Shirt

Item # 4
Long Sleeve
Sweatshirts

Firm Name and Location Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style #

1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MPR $5.85 1. Small - Large Jerzees/29MTXR N/A 1. Small - Large Jerzees/29MR $3.05 1. Small - Large Jerzees/562MR $7.85

14 2. 1X - Large $5.85 2. 1X - Large $7.25 2. 1X - Large $3.05 2. 1X - Large $7.85

3. 2X-Large $8.45 3. 2X-Large $7.25 3. 2X-Large $5.45 3. 2X-Large $9.85

4. 3X Large $8.45 4. 3X Large $7.25 4. 3X Large $7.05 4. 3X Large $11.05

Item # 1
Short Sleeve

T-Shirt with Pocket

Item # 2
Short Sleeve Tall

T-Shirt

Item # 3
Short Sleeve
Active T-Shirt

Item # 4
Long Sleeve
Sweatshirts

Firm Name and Location Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style #

1. Small - Large Jerzees/29MRP $6.05 1. Small - Large Port & Company/PC55T $6.50 1. Small - Large Jerzees/29MR $3.05 1. Small - Large Jerzees/562MR $7.45

15 2. 1X - Large $6.05 2. 1X - Large $6.50 2. 1X - Large $3.05 2. 1X - Large $7.45

3. 2X-Large $8.35 3. 2X-Large $8.00 3. 2X-Large $5.50 3. 2X-Large $9.15

4. 3X Large $9.60 4. 3X Large $9.00 4. 3X Large $6.85 4. 3X Large $10.10

Item # 1
Short Sleeve

T-Shirt with Pocket

Item # 2
Short Sleeve Tall

T-Shirt

Item # 3
Short Sleeve
Active T-Shirt

Item # 4
Long Sleeve
Sweatshirts

Firm Name and Location Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style #

1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MPR $5.46 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MTXR $7.89 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MR $3.89 1. Small - Large Jerzees/562MR $7.97

16 2. 1X - Large $5.46 2. 1X - Large $7.89 2. 1X - Large $3.89 2. 1X - Large $7.97

3. 2X-Large $7.56 3. 2X-Large $9.89 3. 2X-Large $6.39 3. 2X-Large $9.97

4. 3X Large $8.46 4. 3X Large $10.89 4. 3X Large $7.39 4. 3X Large $10.97

Item # 1
Short Sleeve

T-Shirt with Pocket

Item # 2
Short Sleeve Tall

T-Shirt

Item # 3
Short Sleeve
Active T-Shirt

Item # 4
Long Sleeve
Sweatshirts

Firm Name and Location Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style #

1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MPR $4.89 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MTXR $6.69 1. Small - Large Jerzees/29MR $2.61 1. Small - Large Jerzees/562MR $6.32

17 2. 1X - Large $4.89 2. 1X - Large $6.69 2. 1X - Large $2.61 2. 1X - Large $6.32

3. 2X-Large $6.75 3. 2X-Large $6.69 3. 2X-Large $4.67 3. 2X-Large $8.41

4. 3X Large $6.75 4. 3X Large $7.35 4. 3X Large $5.94 4. 3X Large $9.62

Item # 1
Short Sleeve

T-Shirt with Pocket

Item # 2
Short Sleeve Tall

T-Shirt

Item # 3
Short Sleeve
Active T-Shirt

Item # 4
Long Sleeve
Sweatshirts

Firm Name and Location Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style #

1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MPR $5.75 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MTXR $6.70 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MR $3.95 1. Small - Large Jerzee/562MR $8.50

18 2. 1X - Large $5.75 2. 1X - Large $6.70 2. 1X - Large $3.95 2. 1X - Large $8.50

3. 2X-Large $7.50 3. 2X-Large $7.20 3. 2X-Large $5.75 3. 2X-Large $9.98

4. 3X Large $8.50 4. 3X Large $7.75 4. 3X Large $6.95 4. 3X Large $10.99

Item # 1
Short Sleeve

T-Shirt with Pocket

Item # 2
Short Sleeve Tall

T-Shirt

Item # 3
Short Sleeve
Active T-Shirt

Item # 4
Long Sleeve
Sweatshirts

Firm Name and Location Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style #

1. Small - Large Jerzee 29MPR $3.29 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MTXR N/A 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MR $2.37 1. Small - Large Jerzee/562MR $5.88

19 2. 1X - Large $3.29 2. 1X - Large $4.52 2. 1X - Large $2.37 2. 1X - Large $5.88

3. 2X-Large $5.67 3. 2X-Large $4.52 3. 2X-Large $4.10 3. 2X-Large $6.38

4. 3X Large $6.93 4. 3X Large $4.91 4. 3X Large $5.40 4. 3X Large $7.40

Item # 1
Short Sleeve

T-Shirt with Pocket

Item # 2
Short Sleeve Tall

T-Shirt

Item # 3
Short Sleeve
Active T-Shirt

Item # 4
Long Sleeve
Sweatshirts

Firm Name and Location Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style #

20 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MP $7.01 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MT No Bid 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29M $4.82 1. Small - Large Jerzee/562 $9.23

2. 1X - Large $7.01 2. 1X - Large $7.94 2. 1X - Large $4.82 2. 1X - Large $9.23

3. 2X-Large $9.31 3. 2X-Large $7.94 3. 2X-Large $6.86 3. 2X-Large $10.85

4. 3X Large $10.37 4. 3X Large $8.60 4. 3X Large $8.18 4. 3X Large $12.01

Concept Uniform Co            St.
Sharpsburg, PA 15215

SANS Screenprint   Wellington
Rd. Manassas, VA 20109

Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas,
Inc.                    Houston, Texas

77063

Steve Angeline Sales
Springfield, VA 22153

A&A Sales Asso, LLC
Quakertown, PA 18951

Rocky Coast Printworks Inc.
Dover NH 03820

Mastermans LLC          Auburn,
MA 01501



Item # 1
Short Sleeve

T-Shirt with Pocket

Item # 2
Short Sleeve Tall

T-Shirt

Item # 3
Short Sleeve
Active T-Shirt

Item # 4
Long Sleeve
Sweatshirts

Firm Name and Location Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style #

1. Small - Large Jerzees/29MPR $8.38 1. Small - Large Jerzees/29MTXR $9.69 1. Small - Large Jerzees/29MR $5.33 1. Small - Large Jerzees/562MR $11.25

21 2. 1X - Large $8.38 2. 1X - Large $9.69 2. 1X - Large $5.33 2. 1X - Large $11.25

3. 2X-Large $11.24 3. 2X-Large $9.71 3. 2X-Large $8.19 3. 2X-Large $13.76

4. 3X Large $13.09 4. 3X Large $10.61 4. 3X Large $9.67 4. 3X Large $15.40

Item # 1
Short Sleeve

T-Shirt with Pocket

Item # 2
Short Sleeve Tall

T-Shirt

Item # 3
Short Sleeve
Active T-Shirt

Item # 4
Long Sleeve
Sweatshirts

Firm Name and Location Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style #

1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MRP $7.05 1. Small - Large Jerzee/MTXR $4.91 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MR $4.66 1. Small - Large Jerzee/562MR $9.49

22 2. 1X - Large $7.05 2. 1X - Large $8.08 2. 1X - Large $4.66 2. 1X - Large $9.49

3. 2X-Large $9.58 3. 2X-Large $8.08 3. 2X-Large $6.89 3. 2X-Large $11.26

4. 3X Large $10.74 4. 3X Large $8.80 4. 3X Large $8.05 4. 3X Large $12.54

Item # 1
Short Sleeve

T-Shirt with Pocket

Item # 2
Short Sleeve Tall

T-Shirt

Item # 3
Short Sleeve
Active T-Shirt

Item # 4
Long Sleeve
Sweatshirts

Firm Name and Location Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style #

1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MPR $4.99 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MT No Bid 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MR $2.99 1. Small - Large Jerzee/562MR $6.75

23 2. 1X - Large $4.99 2. 1X - Large $5.78 2. 1X - Large $2.99 2. 1X - Large $6.75

3. 2X-Large $6.89 3. 2X-Large $5.78 3. 2X-Large $4.99 3. 2X-Large $7.99

4. 3X Large $7.99 4. 3X Large $6.86 4. 3X Large $5.99 4. 3X Large $8.98

Item # 1
Short Sleeve

T-Shirt with Pocket

Item # 2
Short Sleeve Tall

T-Shirt

Item # 3
Short Sleeve
Active T-Shirt

Item # 4
Long Sleeve
Sweatshirts

Firm Name and Location Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style #

1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MPR $5.84 1. Small - Large Jerzee /29MT N/A 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MR $3.30 1. Small - Large Jerzee/562MR $7.30

24 2. 1X - Large $5.40 2. 1X - Large $6.54 2. 1X - Large $3.30 2. 1X - Large $7.30

3. 2X-Large $8.40 3. 2X-Large $6.96 3. 2X-Large $5.67 3. 2X-Large $10.06

4. 3X Large $9.92 4. 3X Large $8.13 4. 3X Large $7.22 4. 3X Large $11.25

Item # 1
Short Sleeve

T-Shirt with Pocket

Item # 2
Short Sleeve Tall

T-Shirt

Item # 3
Short Sleeve
Active T-Shirt

Item # 4
Long Sleeve
Sweatshirts

Firm Name and Location Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style #

1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MPR $7.75 1. Small - Large Jerzee/MTXR 10.15/N/A 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MR $4.50 1. Small - Large Jerzee/562MR $10.15

25 2. 1X - Large $7.75 2. 1X - Large 2 bids submitted 2. 1X - Large $4.50 2. 1X - Large $10.15

3. 2X-Large $10.30 3. 2X-Large 2 bids submitted 3. 2X-Large $7.75 3. 2X-Large $12.00

4. 3X Large $11.30 4. 3X Large 2 bids submitted 4. 3X Large $8.75 4. 3X Large $13.30

Item # 1
Short Sleeve

T-Shirt with Pocket

Item # 2
Short Sleeve Tall

T-Shirt

Item # 3
Short Sleeve
Active T-Shirt

Item # 4
Long Sleeve
Sweatshirts

Firm Name and Location Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style #

1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MPR $5.41 1. Small - Large Jerzee/MTXR $7.27 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MR $3.40 1. Small - Large Jerzee/562MR $7.06

26 2. 1X - Large $5.41 2. 1X - Large $7.27 2. 1X - Large $3.40 2. 1X - Large $7.06

3. 2X-Large $6.56 3. 2X-Large $8.42 3. 2X-Large $4.65 3. 2X-Large $8.21

4. 3X Large $7.06 4. 3X Large $8.92 4. 3X Large $5.15 4. 3X Large $8.71

Item # 1
Short Sleeve

T-Shirt with Pocket

Item # 2
Short Sleeve Tall

T-Shirt

Item # 3
Short Sleeve
Active T-Shirt

Item # 4
Long Sleeve
Sweatshirts

Firm Name and Location Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style # Manuf/Style #

1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MPR $7.00 1. Small - Large Jerzee/MTXR N/A 1. Small - Large Jerzee/29MR $5.00 1. Small - Large Jerzee/562MR $11.00

2. 1X - Large $7.00 2. 1X - Large $9.00 2. 1X - Large $5.00 2. 1X - Large $11.00

27 3. 2X-Large $8.00 3. 2X-Large $10.00 3. 2X-Large $6.00 3. 2X-Large $12.00

4. 3X Large $9.00 4. 3X Large $11.00 4. 3X Large $7.00 4. 3X Large $13.00

Arrow Safety Device Company
Selbyville, DE 19975

Feury Image Group   Newark, NJ
07105

Sure Promotion Products
Clarksburg, MD 20871

Quality Resource Group Inc.
Plymouth MN 55441

On Source Technology, LLC
Oxon Hill, MD 20750

Sundog Productions LLC
Fairfax, VA 22030

Cintas Corp No. 2  Hughesville,
MD 20637


	Sheet1

