

**BID NUMBER - PURCH 2017-070
UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR, ACCESSORIES, AND ACCOUTREMENTS**

BID COMPARISON

Bidding Firm	SECTION A - UNIFORMS (ITEMS 1 - 7)																				
	Class A Dress Blouse			M- A/B SS Shirt			W- A/B SS Shirt			M- A/B LS Shirt			W- A/B LS Shirt			A/B Uniform Trouser			C & ERT Trouser- DU		
	Unit Price	Est Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est Qty	Total
On Duty Supply	\$267.00	2	\$534.00	\$49.62	70	\$3,473.40	\$49.62	10	\$496.20	\$54.29	70	\$3,800.30	\$54.29	10	\$542.90	\$65.00	70	\$4,550.00	\$26.99	200	\$5,398.00
MD Small Arms Range Inc.	NO BID						NO BID			NO BID			NO BID			NO BID			\$26.00	200	\$5,200.00

Bidding Firm	SECTION A - UNIFORMS (ITEMS 8-14)																				
	Class C Tactical Shirt			ERT Shirt			Academy Pants			M-Academy SS Shirt			W-Academy SS Shirt			M-Academy LS Shirt			W-Academy LS Shirt		
	Unit Price	Est Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est Qty	Total
On Duty Supply	\$34.99	170	\$5,948.30	\$34.99	50	\$1,749.50	\$25.59	10	\$255.90	\$16.29	10	\$162.90	\$16.29	10	\$162.90	\$18.09	10	\$180.90	\$18.09	10	\$180.90
MD Small Arms Range Inc.	\$26.00	170	\$4,420.00	\$26.00	50	\$1,300.00	\$21.00	10	\$210.00	\$17.00	10	\$170.00	\$17.00	10	\$170.00	\$18.00	10	\$180.00	\$18.00	10	\$180.00

2017-070 BID COMPARISON

UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR, ACCESSORIES, AND ACCOUTREMENTS

Bidding Firm	SECTION A - UNIFORMS (ITEMS 15-16)					
	Duty Jacket			V-Neck Sweater		
	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total
On Duty Supply	\$148.00	15	\$2,220.00	\$43.99	70	\$3,079.30
MD Small Arms Range Inc.	\$117.00	15	\$1,755.00	\$72.00	70	\$5,040.00

TOTAL BID SECTION A
\$32,735.40
\$18,625.00

Bidding Firm	Sewing on Patches and Chevrons	Add'l Cost For Oversized Trouser and Pants	Add'l Cost For Oversized Upper Garments	Add'l Cost For Oversized Upper Garments
	Price Per Patch	Price Per Item	Price Per Item	Price Per Item
On Duty Supply	No Charge	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$10.00
MD Small Arms Range Inc.	\$3.00	No Charge	Blauer 6120 3X - \$122.50 4X - \$134.00 5X - \$181.00	Blauer 210 3X - \$80.00 4X - \$84.00 5X - \$115.00

Bidding Firm	SECTION B - FOOTWEAR (ITEM 1-7)																				
	Dress Shoes			8" (D) Boot w/zipper			8" Duty Boot			6" (D) Boot w/zipper			6" Duty Boot			3 Quarter Duty Boot			3 Quarter Duty Boot		
	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total
On Duty Supply	\$50.25	10	\$502.50	\$72.50	70	\$5,075.00	\$70.25	70	\$4,917.50	\$85.25	70	\$5,967.50	\$65.75	70	\$4,602.50	\$87.75	70	\$6,142.50	\$91.75	70	\$6,422.50
MD Small Arms Range Inc.	\$42.00	10	\$420.00	\$56.00	70	\$3,920.00	\$54.00	70	\$3,780.00	\$64.00	70	\$4,480.00	\$62.00	70	\$4,340.00	\$70.50	70	\$4,935.00	\$70.50	70	\$4,935.00

2017-070 BID COMPARISON

UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR, ACCESSORIES, AND ACCOUTREMENTS

TOTAL BID SECTION B
\$33,630.00
\$26,810.00

Bidding Firm	SECTION C - ACCESSORIES (ITEM 1-7)																				
	Hat 5X Winter (REG)			Hat 5X Winter (LO)			Tie			Hat Protectors			Socks			Belt (Duty)			Belt (Sam Browne)		
	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total
On Duty Supply	\$85.00	10	\$850.00	\$85.00	10	\$850.00	\$3.99	70	\$279.30	\$5.90	10	\$59.00	\$3.00	400	\$1,200.00	\$19.79	10	\$197.90	\$69.00	15	\$1,035.00
MD Small Arms Range Inc.***	\$83.75	10	\$837.50	\$83.75	10	\$837.50	\$5.00	70	\$350.00	NO BID			\$2.00	400	\$800.00	\$22.00	10	\$220.00	\$45.00	15	\$675.00

Bidding Firm	SECTION C - ACCESSORIES (ITEM 8-12)														
	Belt Keeper			Belt Buckle (Agency)			Handcuff Case			Handcuffs			Flashlight		
	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total
On Duty Supply	\$5.62	280	\$1,573.60	\$0.00	5	\$0.00	\$29.99	15	\$449.85	\$25.00	15	\$375.00	\$14.99	60	\$899.40
MD Small Arms Range Inc.***	\$2.00	280	\$560.00	NO BID			\$16.00	15	\$240.00	\$22.00	15	\$330.00	\$13.75	60	\$825.00

TOTAL BID SECTION C
\$7,769.05
\$5,675.00

2017-070 BID COMPARISON

UNIFORMS, FOOTWEAR, ACCESSORIES, AND ACCOUTREMENTS

Bidding Firm	SECTION D - ACCOUTREMENTS (ITEM 1-7)																				
	Metal Badge			Tie Bar			Collar Pins			Name Bar			Collar Rank Insignia Pin			Sleeve Chevron			Agency Patch - Main		
	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total
On Duty Supply	\$49.99	5	\$249.95	\$10.50	15	\$157.50	\$8.99	70	\$629.30	\$13.25	70	\$927.50	\$8.05	65	\$523.25	\$2.94	65	\$191.10	\$1.57	500	\$785.00
MD Small Arms Range Inc. ***	NO BID			NO BID			NO BID			NO BID			\$3.15	65	\$204.75	\$2.50	65	\$162.50	\$2.50	500	\$1,250.00

Bidding Firm	SECTION D - ACCOUTREMENTS (ITEM 8-10)								
	Agency Patch - ERT			Rocker			Cloth Badge Patch		
	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total	Unit Price	Est. Qty	Total
On Duty Supply	\$1.70	300	\$510.00	\$0.82	800	\$656.00	\$1.70	220	\$374.00
MD Small Arms Range Inc.***	\$2.00	300	\$600.00	\$2.00	800	\$1,600.00	\$4.00	220	\$880.00

TOTAL BID SECTION D
\$5,003.60
\$4,697.25

*** Total bid appears to be lower because vendor did not submit bid for all items in Section A,C, and D