2017-014 -UNIFORM APPAREL - BID COMPARISON
International Promotional Cintas 3393 Mastermans LP Feury Image Group ABA Sales Assodates “ Printers Ink Chesapeake Uniform Henderson Advertising Uniform Manufacturing
Ttem Cost E"‘:’:’::“"’ Total | 1tem cost E’"'::’::“ Total || 1tem cost E’"'::':stm To || Item Cost E“""c::m' Total Tiem Cost E"""cﬂ“" Total [ ztem cost E'“'::'::“ Total ltem Cost E"“;';':“’ Total Item Cost E'“'::'::“" Total Item Cost E’""g;f’“’ Total
A-1. Men's Polo Shirts - Short Sleeve - Blue Generation BG7206 - NO SUSBTITUTIONS
A-1-1 | $10.46| $5.75| $16.21]| $20.49| $7.50 $27.99| $12.65| $3.95| 4$16.60f1 $15.25 $4.80( $20.05|] $11.38 $4.80| $16.18|| $13.75 $5.95| $19.70|| $15.22| $4.25| $19.47]| si4.60 $1.007  $15.60]
A-1-2 | $10.46| $5.75| $16.21)] $20.49 $7.50 $27.99F oS $12.65 $3.95| $16.60|] $15.25 $4.80| $20.05]] $11.38 $4.80| $16.18 $13.75 $5.95| $19.70 $16.221 $4.25| $19.47 $14.60 $1.00| $15.50
A-1-3 | $11.54] $5.75| $17.29)| $2549| $7.50| $32.99 $13.95] $3.95] $17.94]] $15.25 $4.80| $20.05]] $12.52] $4.80| $17.32|] $14.25( $5.95| $20.20f| $18.22| $4.25] $22.47|| Fie08] %100 $1?.¢}El
A-14 | $13.74) $5.75 $19.49I $25.49|  $7.50| $32.99 $16.65| $3.95| $20.60)1 $15.25 $4.80( $20.05|] $14.81 $4.80] $19.61|| $16.25| $5.95| s$22.20|| $19.22| $4.25| $23.47]| si6.E8 £1.00] $19.88
A-2, Ladies' Polo Shirts - Short Sleeve - Blue Generation BG6209 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
A-2-1 $5.98| $5.75 $15.73I $19.49 $7.50 326.99 NO BID I] $11.93 $3.95( $15.88 $14.55 $4.80| $19.354] $10.77 $4.80| $15.57 $10.85 $5.95] $16.80 $10.22 $4:25] $14.47 $13.93 $1.00] $14.93
A-3. Men’s Polo Shirts - Long Sleeve - Blue Generation BG7208 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
A-3-1 | $14.18) =5.75] $19.94)] $26.49 $7.50] $33.99 $17.20 $3.95( $21.15 $19.95 $4.80; $24.75]] $15.28 $4.80| $20.08 $16.95 $5.95 $22.90I $20.22| $4.25| $24.47 $19.46 $1.00 $20.46
A-3-2 | $14.18] 4575 £19.94]| $26.49 $7.50| $33.99 [y $17.20 $3.95( $21.15 $19.95 $4.801 $24.75]) $15.28 $4.80| $20.08 $16.95 $5.95 $22.90| $20.22| $4.25| $24.47 $15.46 $1.00] $20.46
A-3-3 | %1533 £5.75] $21.08|1 $31.49 $7.50] %38.99 $18.53 $3.95| $22.48 $19.95 $4.80 $24.75]) $16.42 $4.80f $21.22 $17.95 $5.95 $23.90| $21.22| $4.25| $25.47 $20.86 $1.00] $21.86
A-3-4 | $17.49) 3575 $23.24)] $31.49 $7.50f 438.99 $21.20 $3.95 $25.15 $19.95 $4.80 $24.75]] $18.71 $4.80| $23.51 $19.95 $5.95 $25.90I $23.22| $4.25| $27.47 $23.66 $1.00] $24.66
A-4. Ladies’ Polo Shirts - Long Sleeve - Blue Generation BG6207 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
A-4-1 | $12.97| $5.75 $18.72I1 $24.49 $7.50] $31.99 NO BID [L$15.67 $3.95| $19.62 $18.75 34.80 $23.55]) $13.97 $4.80| $18.77 $12.35 $5.95| $18.30 $12.22| $4.25! $16.47 $17.85 $1.00| $18.85
A-5. Men's Button Down Collar Shirts - Short Sleeve - Blue Generation BG72165 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
A-5-1 | $12.14 $5.75| $17.89]| $23.49 $7.50] $30.99 $14.65 $3.95] $18.60 $17.74 $4.80] $22.54]] $13.10 $4.80 $17.90I $14.95 $5.95| $20.90 $17.62( $4.25| $21.87 $16.66 $1.00| $17.66
A-5-2 | $12.14| $5.75| $17.89]] $23.49 $7.50| $30.99 NO BID $14.65 $3.95| $18.60 $17.74 $4.801 $22.54]] $13.10 $4.80 $17.90l $14.95 $5.95| $20.90 $17.62| $4.25] $21.87 $16.66 $1.00] $17.66
A-5-3 § $13.19] $5.75| $18.94)] $28.49 $7.50| $35.99 $15.99 $3.95| 319.94 $17.74 $4.80( $22.54{| $14.24 $4.80| $19.04 $16.35 $5.95| $22.30 $18.62| $4.25| $22.87 $18.18 $1.00] $19.18
A-6. Men’'s Button Down Collar Shirts - Long Sleeve - Blue Generation BG7216 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
A-6-1 § $12.14| $5.75| $17.89)| $23.49 $7.50| $30.99 $14.65 $3.95| $18.60 $17.74 $4.80| $22.54]1 $13.10 $4.80| $17.90 $14.95 $5.95| $20.90 $17.62| $4.25| $21.87 £16.78 $1.00] $17.78
A-6-2 | $12.14| $5.75| $17.89)] $23.49 $7.50] $30.99 NO BID $14.65 $3.95| $18.60 $17.74 $4.80| $22.544) $13.10 $4.80| $17.90 $14.95 $5.95] $20.90 $17.62| $4.25| $21.87 £16.78 £1.007 $17.78
A-6-3 | $13.19| $5.75| $18.94| $28.49 $7.50| $35.99 $15.99 $3.95| 3$19.94 $17.74 $4.80| $22.544| $14.24 $4.80| $19.04 $16.35 £5.95] $22.30 $18.62| $4.25| $22.87 $1B.1B £1.00] $19.1§]
A-7. Men’s Pocket T-Shirts - Short Sleeve - Frult of the Loom 5930P - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED
Substitute Product Substitute Product Substitute Product H| Substitute Product Substitute Product Substitute Product Substitute Product Substitute Product Substitube Product
L $4.73] $5.75] $27.20 $9.00 $7.50| $16.50 $5.07 $6.42 $11.49| $6.32 $3.95| $10.27 $5.95 $4.80| $10.75 $4.60 $4.80( $9.40 $6.95 $5.95 $12.90| $6.55| $4.25 $10.80| 4730 $£1.60 $S.3G|
A-7-2 $4.73] $5.75| $27.20 $9.00 $7.50| $16.50 $5.07 $6.42 $11.49I $6.32 $3.95] $10.27 $5.95 $4.80| $10.75)] $4.60 $4.80| $9.40 $6.95 $5.95 $12.90I $6.55| $4.25 $10.80] i}ﬂ $1.00 sﬂ.ﬂj
A-7-3 | $473| 4575 $27.20f) $9.00[ $7.50| $16.50)| 45.07 s6.42| s11.49  s6.32] 305 s1027 $5.95 $4.80] ¢10.75|] $4.60]  $4.80| $9.40 $6.95|  $5.95 $12.9ol $6.55| $4.25 slo.atj _ $7.30 - s100]  ss30]
A-7-4 $6.54] $5.75| $37.61)] $11.00 $7.50| $18.50 $7.01 $6.42| $13.43 $9.24 $3.95] $13.19 $7.24 $4.80| $12.04]} $6.54 $4.80( $11.34 $8.50 $5.95| $14.45 $8.65| $4.25 $12.‘ﬂ g-_$9.5? £1.00] $10.57)
A-7-5 $6.71| $5.75] $368.58]| 511.00 $7.50| $18.50 $7.19 $6.42| $13.61 $10.45 $3.95] $14.40 $7.50 $4.80| $12.30}) $7.97 $4.80| $12.77 $8.50 $5.95( $14.45 $9.65| $4.25 $13.90| £9.78 $l.l|]l]| £10.73)
A-8. Men's Work Shirts - Long Sleeve - Red Kap SC30LB - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED
s oo ] [
A-8-1 | $19.96] $5.75] $25.21)| $21.49 $7.50( $28.99)| $£16.92 $6.42| s23.34)] $16.91 53.95| $20.86} $17.50 $4.80 $22.30)] $16.65 $4.80( $21.45)| $13.95 $5.95| $19.90|| $16.49| $4.25| $20.74]1| %15.10 $1.00] %1610
A-8-2 | $19.46] $5.75] $25.21)| $2i.49 $7.50] £28.99)] $16.69 $6.42| %23.11)] $16.91 £3.95| $20.88)| $17.50 $4.80 $22.30)| $16.65 34,80 $21.45]| $13.95| $5.95 $19.90f| $16.49] $4.25 $20.74)| %1510 £1.00] $16.10)
A-8-3 | $23.24| $5.75| $28.99)] %2549 $7.50| $32.99)] <2031 $6.42| £26.73 4£20.08 £3.05 $24.03)] $18.95 $4.80| $23.75){ $19.8% $4.80( $24.69 $16.35 $5.95| $22.30 $18.49| $4.25| $22.74 $18.12 £1.00] $i9.12
A-84 | $21.76] $5.75| $27.51f| 321.4% $7.50] 528.99)] $i6:92 $6.42] £23.34 $16.91 $3.95) $20.B6 $18.95 $4.80| 323.75] $16.65 $4.80| $21.45 $13.95 $5.951 $19.90 $17.49| $4.25| $21.74 £15.10 %1.001 %1610
A-8-5 | $25.79] $5.75] $31.54)| 525.49 $7.50) 53299 4$20.31 $6.42 52&,?3“ $20.08 £1.95 $24.D3| $18.95 $4.80| 323.75)] $19.89 $4.80| $24.69 $16.35 $5.95] $22.30 $15.49( $4.25| $23.74 £18.12 £1.00 s19.12
A.9. Reflective T-Shirts - Short Sleeve - Forester 009051 - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED
Substitute Product Substitute Product Substitute Product Substitute Product Substitute Product H Substitute Preduct
kil $12.64| $5.75] $18.39)] $23.49 $7.50| $30.99 $7.88 $6.42] $14.30 $10.59 $4.80{ $15.39 $11.85 $5.95| $17.80 $14.00 $4.25| $18.25 £12.35 £1.00] %:3.35
A.10. Reflective T-Shirts - Long Sleeve - Forester 9051LONG - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED
Substitute Product Substitute Product Substitute Product Substitute Product Substitute Product Substitute Product
A-10-1] $15.49] $5.75] $21.24)| $28.49 $7.501 $35.99)] $11.75 $6.42| $18.17 $14.71 $4.80] $19.51 $15.65 $5.95] $21.60 $16.00| $4.25| $20.25 $13.65 $1.00] $14.65




International Promotional Cintas 3393 Mastermans LP Feury Image Group ABA Sales Assodates Printers Ink Chesapeake Uniform Henderson Advertising Uniform Manufacturing
Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Prica Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
B-1. Men's Work Pants - Dickies 85283 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
B-1-1 $19.74 $24,99 $20.10 $21.57 $21.25 No Bid $22.50 No Bid $21.26
B-1-2 $22.74 $30.99 $22.02 $23.73 $24.65 No Bid $23.50 No Bid $22.03
B-2. Ladies' Work Pants ~ Dickies FP774 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
B-2-1 $18.45 $24.99 $18.06 $19.40 $18.95 No Bid $14.50 No Bid $19.82
B-3. - Men's Work Pants - Red Kap PT10NV - SUBSTITUTIONS FERMITTED
Substitute Product Substitute Product
B-3-1 $21.23 $16.99 $17.94 $17.01 $17.35 Mo Bid $13.90 $21.49 $16.18
B-3-2 $21.23 $16.99 $17.94 $17.01 $£17.35 Mo Bid £13.90 $21.49 $16.18
B-3-3 $21.23 $16.99 $17.94 $17.01 $17.35 Mo Bid i £13.90 $21.49 $17.16
B-3-4 $21.23 $16.99 $17.94 $17.01 £17.35 Mo Bid $13.90 $21.49 $16.18
B-3-5 $21.23 $16.99 $17.94 $17.01 $17.35 Mo Bid $13.90 $21.49 $16.18
B-3-6 $21.23 $16.99 $17.94 $17.01 $17.35 Mo Bid $13.90 $21.49 $17.16
IB-3-? $24.98 $20.55 $21.35 $20.23 £19.95 No Bid l 515,90 $23.49 $19.22
B-4. - Men's Work Pants - Red Kap PT60NV - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED
|B-4-1 $16.49 $16.99 $17.10 $16.23 $16.49 No Bid £15.25 $21.45 $15.43
E—Z $16.49 $16.99 $17.10 $16.23 $16.49 No Bid £15.25 $21.49 $15.43
IB-4-3 $16.49 $16.99 $17.10 $16.23 $16.49 No Bid $£15.25 $21.49 $15.43
IB—4-4 $16.49 $16.99 $17.10 $16.23 $16.49 No Bid #1525 $21.49 $15.43
IB—4-S $16.49 $16.99 $17.10 $16.23 $16.49 No Bid $15.25 $21.49 $15.43
IB-4-6 $18.69 $20.99 $20.34 $19.28 $15.20 No Bid £1B.35 $23.49 $108.33
B-5. Men's Work Pant, Dickies WP314 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
|B-5-1 $17.83 $23.99 $17.34 $19.30 “ $1B.45 No Bid I $19.95 No Bid $19.69
B-6. - Men's Work Pants - Red Kap PT88NV - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED
|B-6-1 $19.89 $22.99 $20.52 $20.29 $20.20 No Bid $17.60 Nl $24.99 $18.31
IB-S-Z $19.89 $22.99 $20.52 $20.29 $20.20 No Bid $17.60 $24.99 $18.31
IB-6-3 $19.89 $22.99 $20.52 $20.29 $20.20 No Bid $17.60 $24.99 $10.31
8-64 $19.89 $22.99 $20.52 $20.29 $20.20 No Bid £17.60 $24.99 $18.31
B-6-5 $19.89 $22.99 $20.52 $20.29 $20.20 No Bid $£17.60 $24.99 $18.31
B-6-6 $19.89 $22.99 $20.52 $20.29 $20.20 No Bid $17.60 $24.99 $18.31
B-6-7 $19.89 $22.99 $20.52 $20.29 $20.20 No Bid £17.60 $24.99 $18.31
B-6-8 $19.89 $22.99 $20.52 $20.29 $20.20 No Bid L $17.60 $24.99 $18.31
B-6-9 $19.89 $22.99 $20.52 $20.29 $20.20 No Bid | $1780 $24.99 $18.31
B-6-10 $19.89 $22.99 $20.52 $20.29 $20.20 No Bid $17.60 $24.99 $18.31
B-6-11 $22.29 $28.99 $20.52 $24.15 $23.20 No Bid £19.95 $27.49 $21.97
B-7. - Women's Work Pants - Red Kap PT89NV - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED
B-7-1 $29.73 $22.99 $41.04 $21.91 $20.99 No Bid $17.50 No Bid $20.87
B-7-2 $29.73 $22.99 $41.04 $21.91 $20.99 No Bid $17.50 No Bid $20.87
B-7-3 $29.73 $22.99 $41.04 $21.91 $20.99 No Bid $17.50 No Bid $20.87




International Promotional Cintas 3393 Mastermans LP Feury Image Group ABA Sales Assodates Printers Ink Chesapeake Uniform Henderson Advertising Uniform Manufacturing
ltem Cost E'“bc':g“ Total  |{ tem cost | E™OEY | vt | wemcost | ™Y | to || nemcost | IS | o | wemcost | UEEEYL o | nem cont EmoeY | Totat || rem cost | ETROREY ) o | | 1tem cost embroery] rota | tem cost | RSV ] ot
C.1 - Men's Hooded Sweatshirt - The Berne Apparel Corporation $2101 NV - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
C-1-1 | $27.36] $5.75] $33.11)] $31.99 $7.50| $39.49 $27.36 $3.95 $31.31" $31.50 $4.80| $36.30 $29.90 $5.95| $35.85 $32.30| $4.25] $36.55 520,82 51.00| %30.82
C-1-2 | $27.36] $5.75] $33.11)] $31.99 $7.50| $39.49 $27.36 $3.95] $31.31 $31.50 $4.80| $36.30 $29.90 $5.95 $35.85 $32.30| $4.25| $36.55 20.82 £1.00] %30.82
C-1-3 | $27.36] $5.75] $33.11)] $31.99 $7.50| $39.49 $27.36 $3.95| $31.31 $31.50 $4.80 $36.30 $29.90 $5.95] $35.85 $32.30| $4.25| $36.55 _E‘;E s $1.ﬂl]i £30.82
C-14 | $27.36| $5.75| $33.11)| $31.99] $7.50] $39.45 No Bid $27.36| $3.95 $31.31)] $31.50 $4.80 $36.30 Ne Bid $31.90 $5.95| $37.85|| $32.30| $4.25| $36.55| | %29.82 $1.cru* $30.82
C-1-5 | $29.44| $5.75| $35.19)| $39.99| $7.50{ $47.49 $30.09 $3.95| $34.04]] $33.50 $4.80f $38.30 $33.90) $5.95| $39.85|f $34.30| $4.25 $38.55)| #32.66 $1.007 $£33.66
C-1-6 | $27.36] $5.75] $33.11|] $31.99 $7.50 $39.49| $27.36 $3.951 $31.31 $33.50 $4.80 $38.30| $29.90 $5.95| $35.85 $32.30] $4.25] $36.55 £20.30 $L'EI-1]"‘ £2 1ﬂl
C-1-7 | $27.36) $5.75| $33.11)| $31.99 $7.50 $39.49I $30.09 $3.95( $34.04 $33.50 $4.80 $38.30| $31.90 $5.95| $37.85 $32.30| $4.25| $36.55 £20.30 £1.00 $21.3i}|
C-2, - Men's Hooded Pullover - The Berne Apparel Corporation SP300 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
C-2-1 | $26.74] $5.75] $32.49|| $33.99 $7.50( 3%41.49 $26.60 $3.95| $30.55 $31.25 $4.80] $36.05 $32.50 $5.95( $38.45 £29.03 _sl 00| =30.03
C-2-2 | $26.74] $5.75| $32.49|| $33.99 $7.50( 341.49 $26.60 $3.95| $30.55 $31.25 $4.80| $36.05 $32.50 $5.95| $38.45 <20.03 £1,004 430.03
C-2-3 | $26.74] $5.75| $32.49|| $33.99 $7.50| $41.49 No Bid $26.60 $3.95| $30.55 $31.25 $4.80 $36.05 No Bid $32.50 $5.95( $38.45 No Bid $£25.03 _ £1.00] %30.03
C-2-4 | $26.74] $5.75| $32.49|] $33.99 $7.50| $41.49 $26.60 $3.95( $30.55 $31.25 $4.80| $36.05 $35.50 $5.95| $41.45 %2003 £1.00] $30.03
C-2-5 | $28.81| $5.75| $34.56|) $38.99 $7.50| 3$46.49 $29.27 $3.95 $33'22H $33.25 $4.80] $38.05 $37.50 $5.95| $43.45 $31 .?9; $1.00% %3278
C-3. - Men's Jacket - White Bear WB-4040 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS

C-3-1 | $38.88| $5.75| $44.63 %40.00 $3.95| $43.95 $41.50 $4.80 $46.30I $42.00 $5.95 $47.95 $42.90| $4.25| $47.15

C-3-2 | $38.88] ¢$5.75| $44.63 $40.00 $3.95| $43.95 $41.50 $4.80 $46.30| $42.00 $5.95| $47.95 $42.50| $4.25| $47.15

C-3-3 | $38.88] $5.75| $44.63 No Bid No Bid %40.00 $3.951 $43.95 $41.50 $4.80 $46.30| No Bid $42.00 $5.95( $47.95 $42.90| $4.25| $47.15 No Bid

C-34 | $38.8B] $5.75| $44.63 £40.00 $3.95 $43.9% $41.50 $4.80 $46.30l $44.00 $5.95| 349.95 $42.90| $4.25] §47.15

C-3-5 | $38.88] $5.75| $44.63 $40.00 33,95 $43.95 $41.50 $4.80| $46.30 $46.00 $5.95| $51.95 $42.90| $4.25] $47.15

C-4. - Men's Jacket - Dickies TJ100 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
C4-1 | $31.95| $5.75( $37.70|] $40.99 $7.50| $48.49|] $32.58 $6.42 3$39.00 $33.33 $3.95| $37.28 $35.60 $4.80| $40.40 $29.00 $5.95| $34.95 $36.40 $1.00) $37.40
C-4-2 | $31.95] $5.75 $37.70)0 $40.99 $7.50| $48.49]] $32.58 $6.42| $39.00 $33.33 $3.95( $37.28 $35.60 $4.80] $40.40 $29.00 $5.95] $34.95 $36.40 $1.00| $37.40
C-4-3 | $31.95| $5.75| $37.70)) $40.99 $7.50| $48.49|1 $32.58 $6.42| $39.00 $33.33 $3.95| $37.28 $35.60 $4.80| $40.40 Ne Bid $29.00 $5.95] $34.95 No Bid $36.40 $i.00] 3$37.40
C-4-4 | $31.95| $5.75| $37.70]] $40.99 $7.50| $48.49|| $32.58 $6.42| $39.00 $33.33 $3.95| $37.28 $35.60 $4.80| $40.40 $32.00 $5.95] $37.95 $36.40 $1.00] $37.40
C4-5 | $34.95| $5.75| $40.70)] $45.99 $7.50| $53.49| $35.82 $6.42| $42.24 $36.67 $3.95| $40.62 $38.15 $4.80| $42.95 $32.00 $5.95| $37.95 $39.90 $1.00 $40.90)
C-5. - Men's Hooded Jacket - Carhartt J131 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
fC-5-1 | $61.77] 45.75| $67.52)] $70.99 $7.50 $7B.49" $51.00 $6.42| $57.42 $76.67 $3.95] $80.62 $72.45 $4.80| $77.25 $61.00 $5.95| $66.95 $60.90 %1.00 $61.90|
C-5-2 | $61.77] $5.75f $67.52)] $70.99 $7.50| $78.49]| $51.00 $6.42| $57.42 $76.67 $3.95] $80.62 $72.45 $4.80| $77.25 $61.00 $5.95| $66.95 $60.90 $1.00 $61.90I
C-5-3 | $61.77 $5.75| $67.52]| $70.99 $7.50| $78.49 [ $51.00 $6.42| $57.42 $76.67 $3.95] $80.62 $72.45 $4.80| $77.25 T $61.00 $5.95| $66.95 No Bid $60.90 %$1.00 $61.90|
C-54 | $61.77| $5.75] $67.52)] $70.99 $7.50| $78.49)| $51.00 $6.42| $57.42 $76.67 $3.95| $80.62 $72.45 $4.80 $77.25 $61.00 $5.95| $66.95 $60.90 $1.00 $61.90I
C-5-5 | $68.37 $5.75] $74.12]] 4$78.99 $7.50| $86.49 | $57.00 $6.42| $63.42 $86.67 $3.95] $90.62 $77.55 $4.801 $82.75 $68.00 $5.95| $73.95 $67.90 $1.00 $68.90I
C5-6 | $68.37] $5.75| $74.12| $78.99 $7.50 $86.49" $57.00 $6.42| $63.42 $86.67 $3.95] $90.62 $77.95 $4.80 $82.75 $63.00 $5.95| $68.95 $67.90 $1.00 $68.90|
C-6. - Men's Hooded Sweatshirt -Forestor 028020 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS
C-6-1 | $39.13] $5.75 $44.BBI] No Bid No Bid $32.28 $3.95| $36.23 $20.75 $4.80| $25.55 No Bid $38.00 $5.95| $43.95 $38.49] $4.25| $42.74 No Bid




International Promotional Cintas 3393 Mastermans LP Feury Image Group ABA Sales Associates Printers Ink Chesapeake Uniform Henderson Advertising Uniform Manufacturing
Item Cost E"“::'::E” Toal || 1tem cost E"“::’::e” Total [ ttem cost | FMONEY | ot | ttem cost emorode | towar || 1tem cost E"'b'C:s‘:e” Tot | atem cost] PRV |t || stem cost Embrodiery | ota Item Cost Emme"' Total | Mem cost | STV | g
D-1. Cover3lls - Red Kap CT10NV - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED
|D~1-1 $32.84| $5.75| $38.59)] $54.00 $7.50 $61.50]1 $51.00 $6.42] $57.42 $22.95 $3.95 $25.95 $4.80 $30.75 $31.00 $5.95| $36.95 $38.30 $1.00] $39.30
|D~1-2 $32.84| §5.75| $38.59)] $54.49 $7.501 $61.99)1 $51.00 $6.42| $57.42)] $22.95 $3.95 $25.95 $4.80( $30.75 $31.00 $5.951 $36.95 $38.30 $1.00] $39.30
ID-1-3 $32.84| $5.75| $38.59)] $54.49 $7.50| $61.99|] $51.00 $6.42| $57.42] $22.95 $3.95 $25.95 $4.80| $30.75 $31.00 $5.95| $36.95 $38.30 $1.00] $35.30]
5—1-4 $33.44| $5.75] $39.19)] $30.49 $7.50| $37.99]1 $25.50 $6.42| $31.92l1 $22.95 $3.95 $25.95 $4.80 $30.75 $21.50 $5.95| $27.45 $21.84 $1.00( $22.84
D-1-5 | $33.44| 4575 $39.19]] $30.49 $7.50] $37.99]1 $25.50 $6.42| $31.92|1 $22.95 $3.95 i $25.95 $4.80( $30.75 ) $21.50 $5.95| $27.45 . $21.84 $1.00| $22.84
D-1-6 | $33.44| $5.75| $39.19]] $30.49 $7.50 $37.99I $25.50 $6.42) $31.92)f $22.95 $3.95 $26.90I $25.95 $4.80| $30.75 No Bid $21.50 $5.95| $27.45 No Bid $21.84 $1.00] $22.84
ID-1-7 $37.38] $5.75| $43.13)] $30.49 $7.50 $37.99I $30.60 $6.42| $37.02)] $22.95 $3.95] $26.90] $25.95 $4.80] $30.75 $24.50 $5.95| $30.45 $26.20 $1.00] $27.20
ID-1-8 $38.48| $5.75| $44.23)| $35.49 $7.50| $42.99|| $30.60 $6.42| $37.02|) $22.95 $3.95| $25.90|1 431.25 $4.80] $36.05 $24.50 $5.95| $30.45 $26.20 $1.00| $27.20
|D-1-9 $44.26| $5.75 $50.01]] $30.49 $7.50| $37.99|| $25.50 $6.42| $31.92|] $22.95 $3.85| 5269001 4$31.25 $4.80| $36.05 $27.50 $5.95] $33.45 $21.84 $1.00] $22.84
D—l-lOI $45.76] $5.75| $51.51)] $36.49 $7.50( $43.99J] $30.60 $6.42{ $37.02 $22.95 $3.95| =26.5001 $31.25 $4.80| $36.05 $27.50 $5.95| $33.45 $26.20 $1.00] $27.20
D-2 - Men's Bib Overalls - Carhartt R02 - NO SUBSTITUTIONS

D-2-1 $85.92 $98.99 $71.40 $79.33 $81.40 $88.10 $77.35

D-2-3 $85.92 $98.99 $71.40 $79.33 $81.40 $88.10 $77.35

D-2-4 $85.92 $98.99 $71.40 $79.33 $81.40 $88.10 $77.35

D-2-5 $85.92 $98.99 $71.40 $79.33 $81.40 No Bid $88.10 No Bid $77.35

D-2-6 $85.92 $98.99 $71.40 $79.33 $81.40 $88.10 $77.35

D-2-7 $85.92 £105.99 $71.40 $79.33 $81.40 $88.10 $77.35

D-2-8 $85.92 $105.95 $71.40 $79.33 $81.40 $88.10 $77.35

D-3 - Coveralls - Red Kap CC18NV - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED

D-3-1 | $41.83] $5.75| $47.58]] $70.49 $7.50 $62.64 $6.42| $69.06JF $34.80 $3.95| $38.75Q] 430.7%5 $'1.Bﬂ] $3555 $44.00 $5.95| $49.95 $53.27 $1.00] $54.27
D-3-2 | $41.83 $5.75| $47.581 $70.49 $7.50 $62.64 $6.42] $69.06 $34.80 $3.95| $38.75 ﬂﬂ.?ﬂj $4.B0| 3$35.55 $44.00 $5.95| $49.95 $53.27 $1.00] $54.27
D-3-3 | $41.83| $5.75| $47.58]] $70.49 $7.50 $62.64 $6.42| $69.06 $34.80 $3.95| $38.75 $30,75 _$4.BD 535.55 $44.00 $5.95] $49.95 $53.27 $1.00] $54.27
D-34 | $42.64] $5.75| $48.39|| $40.49 $7.50 $31.32 $6.42 $37.74| $34.80 $3.95 $3B.75]] $30.75 ; $4.80) $35.55 No Bid $28.50 $5.95] $34.45 No Bid $30.36 $1.00] $31.36
D-3-5 | $42.64] $5.75| $48.39]| $40.49 $7.50 $31.32 $6.42] $37.74 $34.80 $3.95| $38.75 330,75 S4.B0| %3555 $28.50 $5.95| $34.45 $30.36 $1.00] $31.36
D-3-6 | $42.64] $5.75| $48.39]] $40.49 $7.50 $31.32 $6.42| $37.74)] $34.80 $3.95| $38.75|1 %30.75 L4.80] 435.55 $28.50 $5.95 $34.45 $30.36 $1.00] $31.36
D-3-7 | $46.78] $5.75| $52.53]] $46.49 $7.50 $37.59 $6.42| $44.01]] $34.80 $3.95| $3B8.75}f %3075 £4.80 $35..55 $32.00 $5.95| $37.95 $36.45 $1.00| $37.45
D-3-8 | $49.95( $5.75| $55.70§] $46.49 $7.50 $37.59 $6.42| $44.01 $34.80 $3.95 $38.75|| £34.75 $4.80] $39.55 $32.00 $5.95| $37.95 $36.45 $1.00| $37.45




International Promotional Cintas 3393 Mastermans LP Feury Image Group ABA Sales Asscciates Printers Ink Chesapeake Uniform Henderson Advertising Uniform Manufacturing
Tlem Cost Emb'c:std“ Total || ttem cost E’“t’,_'::” Total || Ttem cost E'“b'czlfe"" Total || 1tem cost Em'::’:;d“" Total Ttem Cost E'"t":':';tde” Toml || 1tem cost E'"bc'::m Tol || 1tem cost Embg:“ Total Ttem Cost E"“’C’:':e“' Total Ttem Cost Em%’:ﬁm Totat
E-1. Rain Parka - Grundens PHD44HV - NO SUBSTITUTIONS

E-1-1 £99.75 —

E-1-2 595,75

E-1-3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid £85.75 - No Bid No Bid
E-1-4 $99.75 B

E-1-5 £118,50

E-2. Rain Bib Pant - Grundens PHD16HY - NO SUBSTITUTIONS

E-2-1 SB88.20° B

E-2-2 $HE.20

E-2-3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid o £88.20 Ne Bid No Bid
E-24 0 £88.20

E-2-5 £103.50

E-3. Slush Boots - Cordova BYS17 - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED

E-3-1 $18.90 $38.40 $21.50 $22.95

E-3-2 $18.99 $38.40 $21.50 $22.95

E-3-3 $18.949 $38.40 $21.50 $22.95

E-3-4 No Bid $1-a‘gg_ No Bid $38.40 $21.50 No Bid $22.95 No Bid No Bid
E-3-5 L1899 $38.40 $21.50 $22.95

E-3-6 §15.00 $38.40 $21.50 $22.95

E-3-7 16,99 $38.40 $21.50 $22.95




Intemational Promational Cintas 3393 Mastermans LP Feury Image Group ABA Sales Associates Printers Ink Chesapeake Uniform Henderson Advertising Uniform Manufacturing
ttem Cost | 20 o [} tem cost Fmtoeey | totat || mem cost | FMUEY | Tom || nem cost Emoroe¥ ) to || wemcost | FTOOC | ot | aem cost Emooe | o [ rem cos Emerode | ot ttem Cost | "M ot | nem cost E’"'g::"’ Total
F-1. - Summer Hats - WearGuard® WEB936NV - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED
F-1-1 $2.86] $4.00 $6.8B6 $8.25 $4.50 $12.75“ No Bid Pl.gﬁ $3.10 $5.06n $6.50 $2.45 $8.95 No Bid $5.00 $3.95 $8.95 $2.99| $4.25| ¢$7.24 No Bid
F-2. Winter Hats - WearGuard® WEB-1697 - SUBSTITUTIONS PERMITTED
F-2-1 $3.19 $4.00 $7.19n $8.25 $4.50 $12.75“ No Bid r $2.39 $3.10 $5.49n $5.95 $2.45 $8.40 No Bid $4.75 $3.95 $8.70 $2.99] $4.25( $7.24 No Bid




